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8 TROPITONE
tropitone.com
Available in 20 colors, 
the Chaise Lounge 
Shade adjusts to block 
sunlight throughout the 
day. Available in several 
custom fabrics. 

PRODUCT SHOWROOM

4 ROYAL BOTANIA
royalbotania.com
Made of teakwood, the 
all-weather IXIT Trolley 
can double as a side table. 
Measures 35 in. by 24 in.  

5 VIA MOTIF
viamotif.com
The Silkscreen recycling 
bin is available in a variety 
of colors, and in custom 
designs created by the 
firm’s in-house team.

6 VICTORIA + ALBERT
vandabaths.com
Made of light oak  
or walnut laminate,  
the Tombolo bath 
essentials holder fits 
seamlessly over some of 
the company’s rimless 
baths. Holds two wine 
glasses and towels.  

7 DEDON
dedon.de
The DALA lantern has 
handles for hanging  
and an open weave that 
allows candlelight through, 
while the collection’s 
planter features roto- 
molded internal pots  
and adjustable gliders.
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